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Christmas Giving List 2010 
 
 

Feed a Child for One Month  Goats 

 

For many of the 7300 children in 
Starfish Ministries’ schools, the food 
they receive from our feeding 
program may be the only food they 
eat all day. 
   

One Child/One Month: $3 

 

 

Goats provide families with a 
sustainable source of meat and dairy 
products.  If you choose to give a 
goat, we will make certain it goes to 
one of the neediest Haitian families in 
our ministry area. 

Goat: $35 
 

 
Bibles and Christian Songbooks 

  
Drill a Well 

 

Starfish likes to provide the 
orphanage children and new 
Christians with French Bibles and 
Christian songbooks as they seek to 
grow in their faith. 
 

Bible: $10 
Christian Songbook: $15 

 

 

Most villages where Starfish Minis- 
tries is currently involved do not have 
access to clean water. The vision of 
Starfish is to drill a well in each village 
where sponsored children attend 
school. 

One Share of a Well: $100 
Complete Well: $3000 

 
School Supplies 

  
Guitars 

 

Some of the children in Starfish 
schools cannot afford basic school 
supplies.  Your gift will enable 
Starfish to provide supplies to 
unsponsored students and further 
empower them as they pursue a 
valuable education. 

School Supplies: $10 

 

 

Many of the children in the orphanage 
and schools are already participating 
in music ministry and many more 
children desire to learn to play an 
instrument.  Guitars have been 
favorites of the children. 

 New Guitar Strings: $5 
Guitar: $100 

 
Sandals and Shoes 

  
Soccer Balls 

 

Each year Starfish Ministries pro-
vides a new pair of athletic shoes for 
each of our orphanage children. 
With the rough terrain on which they 
play, their sandals and flip-flops 
don't last very long, so we replace 
them two or three  times a year. 

Sandals: $2 
Shoes: $15 

 

 

Children in Haiti love soccer!  It is one 
of their favorite things to play. The 
orphanage kids are always ready for a 
game with a neighboring village . . . if 
a soccer ball is available. 
 

Soccer Ball: $10 
 

 
Please make checks payable to Starfish Ministries or to pay with credit card go to www.starfishministries.org. For those 

who wish to give gifts in honor of a loved one, there is a printable card available on the website. 


